Georgetown Fire Department Loose Equipment Bid List

Georgetown Fire Department

Loose Equipment List

Line# | QTY DESCRIPTION 5-ALARM TOTAL $ VENDOR AWARDEE
1
2 6 |1 3/4" 50' Red Fire Hose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $802.50
3 8 |1 3/4" 50" Blue Fire Hose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,070.00
4 8 |1 3/4"50' Yellow Fire Hose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,070.00
5 8 |1 3/4" 50" Green Fire Hose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,070.00
6 8 |1 3/4" 50' Black Fire Hose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,070.00
7 6 |2 1/2" 50' Orange Fire Hose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,087.50
8 16 |2 1/2" 50' White Fire Hose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,700.00
9 4 |1"x 50' White Fire Hose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $272.00
10 10 |[TFT 1.75" Handline Nozzle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,000.00
11 2 |TFT 2.5" Handline Nozzle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,900.00
12 2 |TFT 1" Pistol Grip Nozzle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $368.00
15 2 |MSA Thermal Imaging Camera 6000 Series No Bid $7,362.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $14,725.00 5-Alarm
16 2 |MSA 4 Gas No Bid $1,015.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,030.00 5-Alarm
21 12 |90500 Streamlight Survivor w/o Chargers $137.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $995.40
22 2 |90400 Streamlight 120 V, 5 Bank Chargers $289.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $585.54
23 2 |Streamlight Single Charger 120 V No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.00
25 2 |16" Rescue Saw Model 2188 $2,195.00 | $1,883.00 No Bid No Bid $5,239.08
27 2 |Genesis 17¢c EFORCE Brute Combination Tool No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22,365.00
30 2 |585 A DUO Safety 10FT Attic Ladder No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $394.00
31 2 |775 A DUO Safety 14FT Roof Ladder No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $550.00
34 2 |900 A DUO Safety 24FT Extb Lader No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,170.00
36 4 |KOCHEK 6" x 10' Hard Suction 2P602-10-A52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,560.00
41 2 |Super Vac 18" Fan 4 Milwaukee 12 AH Batteries No Bid No Bid $4,589.00 No Bid $8,970.00
42 2 |Streamlight, Portable Scene Light M#45670 $741.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,349.90
43 2 |Streamlight Portable Scene Lights #46000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,090.00




